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                      DESCRIPTION                                     PRICE             VENDOR 
 
I.     CLEANING SOLUTIONS: 

 
 1.       Austin Ammonia, Gallon Bottle *No Substitutions 4 Gal/Case        $8.45/case      Chudy           
 
 2.        Austin Ammonia Quart Bottle 12/32 Oz/Case            $7.95/case        Chudy 
             
 3.      Austin-101 Bleach, 6-128 Oz/Case *No Substitutions                $8.05/case Dobmeier 
 
 4.       Austin-A1 Bleach, 6-1 Gallon Jugs/Case *No Substitutions            $8.65/case Dobmeier 
 
 5.    Clorox Bleach, 6/96 Oz *No Substitutions                                        $11.00/case Dobmeier 
 
 6.       Babo Cleanser, Chlorinated Inst. Powdered, 24-21 Oz/Case          $11.35/case Chudy 
    
 7.       All Purpose Cleaner - Corr Brand Only! 5 Gallon Cans,                   $27.65/each Corr 
            3 Oz. per Gallon for General Cleaning  - *No Substitutions 
  
 8.        Champion #2057 Heavy Duty All Purpose Cleaner                        $15.24/case Corr 
            18 Oz. *No Substitutions 
 
 9.       General Purpose Deodorizer Cleaner, 1/2 Oz. Packet            $21.50/case Chudy                           
         Stearns Brand (makes 4 gallons) – 50/case 
              
10.      Dual Quat Lemon Scent Disinfectant Hard Surface Cleaner            $75.48/case  Corr 
            Corr Brand Only! MPC - 1 Gallon Containers - 6/Case 
            *No Substitutions 
 
11.       SSS Pleasant Clean Disinfectant Spray w/one Sprayer             $16.40/case   Dobmeier 
            12-32 Oz/Case 
 
12.       Lemon Disinfectant, 16 Oz. Cans #TS224-20                                   $1.48/each  Corr 
            BRAND: Spray Pak 
 
13.       Disinfectant Deodorant Aerosol 12-16.5 Oz/Case                         $17.80/case  Corr 
            Spray Pack *No Substitutions 
 
14.        Lemon Disinfectant Spray 16 oz. Cans 12/Case                              $17.80/case     Corr 
             Spray Pack *No Substitutions 
    
15.        Super Sassafrass - Neutra Clean Corr Brand Only!                         $19.29/case     Corr 
              4 Gallons/Case - *No Substitutions 
 
16.        Neutral Cleaner Salt Neutralizer     $16.50/case     Corr 
  4 Gal/Case *No Substitutions 
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               DESCRIPTION                    PRICE              VENDOR 
 
I.      CLEANING SOLUTIONS - CONTINUED:    
 
17.       Simple Green, Lemon Scent, 6/1 GALLON Refill       $70.60/case        Corr 
            *No Substitutions 
 
18.       Johnson Stride Floral No Rinse Neutral Cleaner                  $32.85/case        Dobmeier 

  
            4 Gal/Case *No Substitutions 
 
19.       Johnson Virex RTD Disinfectant Cleaner #4337*No Substitutions       $18.20/each        Dobmeier              
 
20.      Mr Clean Summer Citrus 12/28 Oz         $23.29/case        Dobmeier 
  
21.      Deodorizer (Odor) SC Johnson-Good Sense RTD 4-64 Oz./Case       $121.48/case      Dobmeier 
  *No Substitutions 
 
22.        Deodorant Super C w/Wick, 1.5 Oz., 12/Case          $16.25/case        Dobmeier 
             BRAND: SSS Super D 
 
23.        Aspree Air Freshener Kit - Contains Dispenser Unit                    $53.90/each        Corr 
              & 3 Refills  *No Substitutions 
                        
24.        Microburst 9000 Linen Fresh Air Deodorizer TC401244, 5.3 oz.     $29.89/case        Dobmeier 
  4/case  “No Substitutions” – Dispenser under miscellaneous           
 
25.         DeScales Hard Water Cleaner, Gallon 4/Case                                    $24.09/case        Corr 
              BRAND: Bullit 
 
26.         Betco Hard Surface Cleaner, Gallon - Pine or Mint        $5.21/each          Corr 
  *No Substitutions 
 
27.        Aerosol Cleaner, Non-Ammonia Formula                                              $15.50/case        Corr 
             12-19 Oz/Case - SSS Misty (Glass Cleaner for Library) 
              BRAND: Spray Pak 
 
28.        Glass Cleaner, -Glance Brand – Gallon *No Substitutions                  $3.10/each          Dobmeier 
                            
29.        Glass Cleaner, Bulk 5 Gallon Containers                             $13.20/each        Dobmeier 
             BRAND:  Glance 
 
30.        Glass Cleaner  Ammonia Formula 12-19 Oz/Case                               $15.50/case        Corr      
             BRAND: Spray Pak 
 
31.      Glass Cleaner- SC Johnson " Glance RTD"                                          $55.80/case        Dobmeier 
             2/1.5L/Case, *No Substitutions New non-ammoniated green seal 
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I.    CLEANINGSOLUTIONS - CONTINUED 
 
32.     Johnson Breakup, JW3313117                                                    $147.45/case       Dobmeier 
          4-64 Oz./Case *No Substitutions     
 
33.      Super Shine All - Super Sassafrass                      $31.30/case         Corr 
           4 Gallons/Case *No Substitutions 
 
34.      Liquid Sunshine Lemon Polish - 12 Quarts/Case                  $32.52/case        Corr   
 
35.      Murphy Oil Soap 2.5 Gallon/Pail Container, 2/Case                    $30.00/case         Griffin 
           BRAND: W.O.W. 
 
36.      Murphy Oil Soap, 32 Oz., 12/Case                     $35.45/case         Dobmeier 
           BRAND: CPL1106 
 
37       Murphy Oil Soap - Jelly 1# 12/Case                   No Bid 
            
38       Lysol Type Germicidal Lemon Scent Foaming Cleaner               $16.39/case         Corr 
           Select, 12-19 Oz./Case 
           BRAND: Spray Pak 
 
39        Pine Sol Type All Purpose Cleaner, 12-32 Oz./Case                  $16.10/case         Dobmeier 

BRAND: SSS Pleasant  
 
40.       Spic and Span  #97144, 12-27 Oz./Case                                    $72.14/case         Dobmeier 
             BRAND: #84959158 
 
41        Spic and Span Liquid, 3 Oz. Packets *No Substitutions             $21.80/case          Dobmeier 
 
42.        Multiple Purpose Concentrate “The One” 5 Gallon Pail       $395.00/pail         Griffin 
 *No Substitutions 
 
43.         Stainless Steel Cleaner, 12-32 Oz/Case                                   $20.00/case          Griffin 
               BRAND: W.O.W. 
 
44.         Baseboard Cleaner, Champion #1625 12-20 Oz./Case            $20.49/case          Corr 
              *No Substitutions 
  
45.          Gum Remover, Champion #1608,12-8 Oz/Case                      $16.94/case          Corr 
               *No Substitutions 
 
46.           A.O.K. Metal Polish - Brass Pint Bottles                               $30.00/case          Griffin 
        BRAND: W.O.W. 
 
47.           Vandal Mark Remover, “Rite-Off Type 16 Oz. 12/case           $32.58/case          Corr 
                BRAND:  Spray Pak 
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I.   CLEANING SOLUTIONS – CONTINUED 
 
48.     Lysol Spray Linen 19 Oz-12/Case Fresh Linen              $27.00/case     Corr 
 
49.       Drain Opener, Liquid - Odorless, Non-Fuming, 12 oz.            $24.14/case      Corr 
            BRAND: Corr 
 
50.       Degreaser - Safety Solvent 12-32 Oz/Case                  $18.50/case     Dobmeier 
            BRAND: SS DC Plus 
 
51.       Degreaser - Johnson Spitfire RTD #JW3165361               $152.10/case   Dobmeier 
   4-64 Oz/Case,  *No Substitutions 
 
52.        Degreaser - Potin, Gallon *No Substitutions                           No Bid 
 
53.        Degreaser - Corr's " Orange It" Natural Citrus                 $25.51/each      Corr  
             Extract & Emulsifiers, Gallon *No Substitutions 
 
54.        Grease Runner - 10 4-Gallons/Case                                      $14.90/cases     Dobmeier 
             BRAND:  Johnson GP-1 
 
55.        Oven Cleaner - Non-Aerosol Pump Spray - 32 Oz.                $2.21/each        Corr 
             *MSDA Sheets Required 
     BRAND: Corr 
 
56.         Flash Back Spray, 55 Gallon Drum, *No Substitutions         $695.00/each     Corr 

        
57.         SSR Specialty Surface Restorer 12-32 Oz/Case                  $165.00/case     Griffin  
              *No Substitutions   
 
58.         SSM Specialty Surface Maintainer12-32 Oz/Case                $189.00/case     Griffin    
              *No Substitutions  
 
59.         Dust Mop Treatment 12-32 Oz./Case                $25.00/case       Griffin 
              BRAND: W.O.W. 
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II.   BATHROOM CLEANERS : 
 
  1.      Bathroom Cleaner Non-Acid Disinfectant,    $14.10/case Chudy 
           12-32 Oz/Case 
           BRAND: NCL Bathroom Plus 
 
  2.       Acidulated Shower Cleaner, Gallon    $17.88/case Chudy 
 30% Active Ingredients, 4/Case 
            BRAND: NCL Wrangler 
 
  3.       Blue Acid Bowl Disinfectant Cleaner, Quart   $13.60/case Dobmeier 
           12/Case, BRAND: SSS Mint  
 
  4.       Blue Liquid Disinfectant Toilet Bowl Cleaner   $5.38/each      Corr 
            Gallon, BRAND: Corr 
 
  5.       Sani-flush Disinfectant  40 Oz. Cans, 12/Case                      $27.60/case Dobmeier 
            *No Substitutions 
 
  6.       Urinal Screen with non-para Block, 4 oz. 12/Pkg.                  $10.29/pkg      Corr 
  Continental Super Kleen Screen   *No Substitutions 
 
  7.        Urinal Screen with non-para Block, 8 oz. 6/Case                  $15.00/case Chudy 
             Nilodor Inc. #8000    *No Substitutions 

               
  8.        Disinfectant Packs for Cleaning Toilets - Dracket Dibs         $12.30/case    Dobmeier 
             90-½ Oz./Case, BRAND: Drac #90652 1-90 kg 
 
  9.        Porcelain Tile & Soap Scum Cleaner 12-32 Oz/Case         $20.00/case  Dobmeier 

 BRAND: SSS PST  
 
 10.       Tile and Scum Remover, SSS Brand, Gallon, 6/Case          $24.09/case     Corr 
             *No Substitutions 
 
 11.       Toilet Bowl & Porcelain Cleaner, Quart - 12/Case                $13.65/case     Dobmeier 

 BRAND: SSS Disinfectant 
 

 12.       Johnson Envy Cleaning Deodorant Cleaner JW04528        $74.95/case     Dobmeier 
 Non-Abrasive, Contains no Ammonia, 12/Case  
*No Substitutions 
 

 13.     Johnson Triad RTD II, JW314342904335 Cleaner                $44.20/case     Dobmeier  
            4/64 Oz./Case  *No Substitutions 
 
 14.      Air x 44, #RX44HDQGallon, *No Substitutions                       $8.65/each      Dobmeier 
   
 15.      Orange Solvent, Gallon #1131, 4/Case                                   $65.57/case    Corr 
            *No Substitutions 
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III. RUG CLEANERS:      
 
  1.        Carpet Shampoo, 6-Gallons/Case             $30.00/case  Griffin 
              BRAND: W.O.W. 
 
  2.         Rug & Upholstery Shampoo, #A118, Gallon               $6.00/each       Griffin 
              BRAND: W.O.W. 
 
  3.         Carpet Maintenance Spot Solvent Plus, 32 Oz. Cans           $2.18/each        Corr 
              BRAND: Corr Spot Check 
 
  4.         Carpet & Room Deodorizer, Spartan Airlift, 12/32 Oz.          $24.10/each      Dobmeier 
              BRAND: Spartan 
 
  5.         Imperial Majestic Carpet Sanitizer for Extraction              $10.29/each      Dobmeier   
              *No Substitutions 
 
  6.    SSS Heavy Duty Carpet Stain Remover 15 Oz, 12/Case     $2.38/each        Dobmeier 
               BRAND:  SSS HD Carpet Stain 
 
 
IV.      STRIPPERS AND WAXES: 
 
  1.       Mop On Restorer "Flashback" 5 Gallon Drum               $71.78/each      Corr 

*No Substitutions 
 
  2.        Dust Mop Treatment #1626, 20 Oz. 12/Case               $28.90/case      Corr 
             *No Substitutions 
 
  3.         Floor Wax Classic, 22 percent solids                           $49.04/each      Corr      
              For High Speed Buffing, 5 Gallon Cans *No Substitutions 
 
  4.         Floor Wax Classic 22 percent solids                           $473.00/drum    Corr 
              55 Gallon Drums, *No Substitutions 
 
  5.          Floor Wax "Century 21" 55 Gallon Drum                    $721.00/drum     Corr 
               *No Substitutions 
 

    6.         Johnson Complete Floor Wax #4649, Gallon                       $16.85/each        Dobmeier  
                *No Substitutions  
                                 
    7.         Johnson Complete Floor Wax #4651, 5 Gallon Drum    $76.55/each        Dobmeier 

     *No Substitutions 
 
   8.         Johnson Vectra Floor Finish, 55 Gallon Drum                     $1,121.25/drum   Dobmeier     
               *No Substitutions  
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   DESCRIPTION        PRICE          VENDOR 
 
IV.      STRIPPERS AND WAXES: 
 
 9.     Floor Sealer "First Step" 55 Gallon Drum                         $493.00/drum  Corr 
         *No Substitutions         
 
10.    Floor Finish “Yes Yes Brand” 5 Gallon/Pail                      $75.00/each    Griffin 
        *No Substitutions       
 
11.    Floor Finish P & G 25% Solids *No Substitutions              No Bid 
 
12.   Johnson “Bravo” Floor Stripper #4576, 5 Gallon Pails      $65.15/each     Dobmeier 
        *No Substitutions 
 
13.    Strip & Go Stripper 50% Active, 55 Gallon Drum             $598.00/drum   Corr 
         *No Substitutions 
 
14.    Floor Stripper"AMM-Strip" 55 Gallon Drums                     $546.00/drum   Corr 
         *No Substitutions 
 
15.    Super Stripper Plus Corr #1133 Gal 4/Case                     $39.19/case      Corr 
         *No Substitutions 
 

 16.     Linosafe Stripper 5 Gallon  *No Substitutions                   $99.50/each     Dobmeier 
 
17.    Granite Hard Surface Sealer/Finish #1100                       $15.87/each      Corr 
         Gallon - *No Substitutions 
 
18.    Granite Hard Surface Sealer, 55 Gallon Drum                 $483.00/each     Corr 
          BRAND: Granite 
 
19.    Johnson Lemon Scent Furniture Polish Aerosol -            $48.20/case       Dobmeier       
         15 Oz. No Substitutions, 12/Case 
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V. SOAPS:      
 
1. Dial Liquid Anti-Bacterial Soap with Dispenser 16 Oz.     $3.03/each     Dobmeier  
 *No Substitutions  
 
2. Dial Liquid Anti-Bacterial Soap #3904396 Gallon       $9.32/each     Dobmeier  
 *No Substitutions  
 
3.  Dial Liquid for Sensitive Skin, Gallon *No Substitutions            $9.78/each      Dobmeier 
 
4.  Dial Anti-Bacterial Liquid Soap #CM584017, Liter                 $37.38/case    Dobmeier 
 *No Substitutions – (Must fit in Model 21 Dispenser) 
 
5.  Dial Antibacterial #D97501 12/800 ML *No Substitutions      $44.20/case    Dobmeier 
 
6.         Cormatic Antiseptic Ultima Hand Soap GP #8956 Liter Bottle  $58.90/case    Dobmeier 
            10/Case *No Substitutions!  
 
7.         Cormatic Head & Body Shampoo GP #S8401 Liter Bottle     $58.75/case    Dobmeier                  

10/Case *No Substitutions! 
               
8. Head & Body Shampoo #58401 Gallon 4/Case      $30.75/case    Dobmeier 
 BRAND:  Dial #3986 Total Body 
 
9.  DL Type Fast Orange Hand Cleaner with Pumice                     $31.24/case   Dobmeier 
 BRAND:  DL25116 12-14 Oz/Case 
 
10.  DL Type Fast Orange Hand Cleaner with Pumice 128 Oz.        $12.50/each    Dobmeier 
 With Pump Dispenser, Citrus Scented  
 BRAND: DL 
 
11. Kresto Hand Cleaner #87044, 2000 ML Container  6/Case       No Bid 
 *No Substitutions  
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V.    SOAPS - CONTINUED:   
 
12.   Aero Instant Foaming Hand Sanitizer #57210 1 Liter, 8/Case  $79.70/case    Corr 
        *No Substitutions 
 
13.   Aero Instant Hand Sanitizer DEB SBS Foam Soap System  $75.16/case    Corr 
        Non Alcohol Foaming Hand Sanitizer 500 ML Pump Bottle 
        6/Case    
        BRAND: Aero Instant 
 
14.   Hand Type Sanitizer – Purell Type 8 Oz. Pump #9652-12               $29.95/case    Corr 
        12/Case 
        BRAND:  Kutol 
 
15.   Scrubs in a Bucket Towel/Hand Cleaner *No Substitutions                   $9.80/each      Dobmeier 
 
16.    Austin Suds Pots and Pans – Gallon 4/Case                $13.97/case    Dobmeier 
         BRAND: Austin 
 
17.    Liquid Laundry Detergent with Bleach, Gallon 4/Case     $34.17/case    Corr 
         BRAND: Washbryte 
 
18.    Tide 26 Oz. Box *No Substitutions      $3.91/box        Dobmeier 
 
19.     Laundry Detergent 2 oz. Single Load Boxes      $25.90/case    Dobmeier 
          Phosphate Free – Without Bleach Additive – Powder  
          Lever “Ultra All” or Equal  
          BRAND: Ultra All 
 
20.     Laundry Soap 44# Box       $16.20/box       Dobmeier 
          BRAND:  Fiesta 
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VI.  JANITORIAL SUPPLIES - MISCELLANEOUS: 
 
  1.        Counter Duster Brush, 50/50 Natural Horsehair & Styrene Fiber   $1.98/each Corr 
              fill for polished or finished surfaces 
              BRAND: Marino 
                         
2.           Dairy Brush, Short Handle - Hardwood, Palmetto #505           $1.26/each Dobmeier                
     BRAND: Wilen #1301108 
 
3.           Deck Brush 10", Palmyra #192                                                      $2.20/each Dobmeier 
              BRAND: Wilen #1002010 
 
4.           Floor Brush for hardwood and fine floors 18" head                       $5.02/each         Corr                         
              BRAND: Marino 
 
5.           Hand Scrub Brush 2 3/4"x8x1, Hardwood Palmetto #504             $1.14/each Corr 
              BRAND: Marino 
 
6.           Nail Brush 1-1/2" x 3"                                                $ .96/each        Dobmeier           
                           BRAND: Daisy 
 
7.           Pantry Scrub Brush - Hardwood, Empire #490537            $1.49/each Dobmeier  
              BRAND: Wilen 1304108 
 
 8.          Scrub Brush - Rubbermaid #6482 12/Case             $18.48/case    Dobmeier                  
          BRAND: RM6482 
 
 9.          Scrub Brush, with iron handle 6" long             $ .94/each Corr                               
              BRAND: Marino 
 
10.         Radiator Brush  Wilen #2276                                    $2.15/each Dobmeier   
              BRAND: Wilen 
 
11.         Tile & Grout Brush (toothbrush size)             $1.43/each        Dobmeier    
               BRAND: RM9B56 
 
12.         Toilet Bowl Brush - Rubbermaid #6310             $ .99/each         Corr                             
               BRAND: Marino 
 
13.         Bowl Mop #790                $ .41/each         Chudy 
              BRAND: Tolco 
 
14.         Swivel Scrubber #5310               $7.18/each Corr 
              BRAND: Marino 
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VI. JANITORIAL SUPPLIES - MISCELLANEOUS - CONTINUED: 
 
15.       Bowl Swabs, 100/Case                                                                    $41.00/case Chudy 
            BRAND: Tolco 
 
16.       Broom –Angle soft bristle nylon #960                                             $2.16/each Dobmeier 
            BRAND: #960 
 
17.       Broom - Corn 8" Trim, Steel Handle                                              $8.00/each Dobmeier 

Durable Polypropylene Bristle Milw #437103 
BRAND:  Wilen E515012 

  
18.       Broom - Corn 100%, 5 Sew/Wooden Handle, 10” overall           $3.79/each Dobmeier 
            BRAND: Maids 
 
19.       Broom - Lobby Push,Toy Corn Broom     $1.80/each Dobmeier 
  (#26F18 Type) 

BRAND: Toy Corn Broom 
 
20.       Broom - Lobby  Push, Abco (#BR-1021MC Type)                  $1.87/each Dobmeier   
 BRAND: Wilen E503500 
 
21.       Broom - Lobby Push 24" Floor Brush – Hardwood   $6.28/each Corr 
            BRAND: Marino 
 
22.       Broom - Lobby, Rubbermaid #5W637 *No Substitutions!             $2.86/each Corr 
    
23.       Broom - Street 16" with Handle - Hardwood                                     $7.15/each Dobmeier 
            BRAND: Wilen F201016 
 
24.       Handle for Push Broom 5' Luminated Handle - Hardwood           $1.76/each Corr 
    
25.       Handle - Sweep 60" length, thread 15/16" diameter, Hardwood    $1.76/each Corr 
            To fit above 18" Floor Brush  
 
26.       Handle, 3M Wood Threaded w/metal tip    $2.00/each Dobmeier                      
             BRAND: HAM25457    
 
27.       Dust Mop, Corr #2507, 3"x24" Blue  *No Substitutions                     $6.55/each Corr 
                      
28.       Dust Mop Head to fit #C1016H 3"x9" *No Substitutions    No Bid 
                                 
29.       Dust Mop - Rubbermaid #M150 Select-A-Length Dust Mops       $61.88/each Dobmeier 
            40' L x 5"W, *No Substitutions 
  
30.        Dust Mop - Snap-On Wire Frame, Rubbermaid #M253                 $1.80/each Dobmeier 
             24" L x 5" W, *No Substitutions – GS37373 
                                
 



 
COUNTY OF ERIE, STATE OF NEW YORK                                PAGE 2L OF 6 PAGES 
DIVISION OF PURCHASE                                                              95 FRANKLIN STREET, ROOM 1254 
INVITATION TO BID NO. 290001-004                                              BUFFALO, NEW YORK 14202 

 
                                

  DESCRIPTION                             PRICE            VENDOR 
 

VI. JANITORIAL SUPPLIES - MISCELLANEOUS - CONTINUED: 
 
31.        Dust Mop - Snap On Wire Frame, Rubbermaid #M255  $2.21/each Dobmeier    
              48" L x 5" W, *No Substitutions 
 
32.        Dust Mop - Snap On Wire Frame, Rubbermaid #M257       $3.49/each Dobmeier 
             48" L x 5" W, *No Substitutions 
 
33.        Dust Mop - Snap On Hardwood Handles,                                    $5.40/each Dobmeier 
             Rubbermaid #M116, *No Substitutions 
                             
34.         Dust Mops 24” 100% Cotton, 60” Steel Handle                            $5.95/each Dobmeier    
   Libman,  “No Substitutions”           
 
35.         Mop - 12 Pack Cotton  20 Oz. Tangle Free - Newell       $2.18/each Dobmeier                      
               BRAND: GS37111 
 
36.         Wet Mop - Rubbermaid  #RM516, 16 Oz. Dura Pro Blend          $2.29/each Corr 
              Open-End, Cotton Rayon - *No Substitutions 
 
37.         Wet Mop - Rubbermaid #RMF518, 24 Oz. Dura Pro Blend        $3.08/each Corr 
              Pro Blend, Open-End, Cotton Rayon -*No Substitutions 
 
38.          Wet Mop – Rubbermaid #A252-06 Antimicrobial Looped End   $4.16/each Corr 
                Blue *No Substitutions 
 
39.          Mop Handles 54" Wooden Wing Nut Type,               $4.16/each Corr 
               To Wide Mop Head  

    
40.          Wet Mop Handles – Antimicrobial Gripper #RCP H22   $8.96/each Corr 
    Aluminum 60”   *No Substitutions 
           
41.          Mop Handle, Jaw Type #513 - *No Substitutions                        $8.96/each Corr 
 
42.          Mop Handles 64" #95 with Wooden Handle,                               $4.66/each Corr 
      
43.          Mop Handle - Invader 60" #H136, Abco                                      $7.25/each Chudy 
               BRAND: Wilen 
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VI. JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS - CONTINUED: 
 
44.         Mop Handle - Continental #596 12/Case, *No Substitutions $85.93/each Dobmeier      
                         
45.         Mop Handle - Continental #601 Abco 60" Fiberglass               $84.00/each Chudy 
              *No Substitutions 
 

  46.         Mop Heads 16 Oz. Layflat - Regular Screw Head                  $2.77/each   Chudy 
                
47.          Mop Heads Rubbermaid #D212, 24 Oz. Medium         $4.40/each  Dobmeier 
               Super Stretch, Blue  *No Substitutions  
                                  
48.          Mop Heads Rubbermaid #D213 Large, 1" Band                      $3.08/each  Corr 
               *No Substitutions 
                            
49.           Mop Heads Can-Cot #20048, Intrepid, Super Stretch,             $4.65/each  Corr 
                Orange - Tangle Free 

    
50.           Mop Heads Rayon Noram #16120 CR 10 oz  12/case  $1.50/each  Dobmeier 
      
51.           Mop Heads  “Tuway 30” Micro Fiber *No Substitutions  No Bid 
 
52.           Wax Mop Heads, Cotton or Rayon 20 Oz.                                $2.32/each  Dobmeier 
                 
53.           Roller Sponge Mop with Handle #2265 *No Substitutions        $18.37/each  Dobmeier 
 
54.           Refill for Roller Sponge Mop #2265 *No Substitutions             $5.56/each  Corr 
 
55.           Downward Pressure Wringer - Continental #CM16/24  $143.80/each   Dobmeier 
                Zinc electroplated, Includes Handle  Metal - *No Substitutions 
 
56.            Downward Pressure Wringer - Continental  #CM24/36            $156.00/each   Dobmeier 
                 Zinc electroplated, Includes Handle -  Metal *No Substitutions 
 
57.            Mop Bucket Continental #CYR305-3-With 3" Casters      $22.82/each    Corr 
                 Yellow 35 Qt. Oval/Round *No Substitutions 
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       DESCRIPTION               PRICE               VENDOR 
 
VI. JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS - CONTINUED: 
 
58.      Bucket, Rhino 26 Quart Mop Bucket With 3" Casters               $39.05/each Dobmeier 
         with Wringer -  RHINO ONLY! - No Substitutions 
 
59.     Bucket with Wringer Combo Pack #305.33- White Brand         $35.35/each Dobmeier 
               BRAND: CON335-312 
 
60.     Bucket w/Wringer Combo, downward press wringer 35 Quart  $44.63/each Corr 
               BRAND:  Marino 
 
61.     Bucket 10 Quart Continental #8110 Gray or White                    $2.71/each           Corr 
               BRAND: Marino 
 
62.     Bucket 14 Quart Continental #8114 Gray                    $2.71/each           Corr 
               BRAND: Marino 
 
63.           Bucket 3 Gallon with Wire Handle – Rubbermaid #FG29600   $2.71/each   Corr 
                BRAND: Marino 
 
64.      Dust Pan - Continental (Lobby #712 Type)          $1.35/each   Chudy 
                 BRAND: Continental 
 
65.       Dust Pan - Continental (Lobby #812 Type)          $5.48/each   Dobmeier 
                  BRAND: CON912 
 
66.        Dust Pan – Continental #715 Steel                                          $2.65/each            Dobmeier 
                  BRAND: 715 
 
67.        Dust Pan - Rubbermaid  #5W637,*No Substitutions         $3.08/each   Dobmeier 
 
68.        Doodle Duster 3M, 7" x 13.8" PC, 250/Roll, *No Substitutions $49.60/each        Dobmeier 
                   
69.         Doodle Bug Pads - Rough, 20/Case - *No Substitutions          $11.67/each   Corr 
 
70.        Doodle Duster Frames, 3M #19150, *No Substitutions            $31.75/each   Dobmeier 
 
71.          Doodle Duster Frames, #19151                                                $40.96/each   Dobmeier 
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VI.   JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS - CONTINUED: 
 
72.      Duster, Lambs wool #STDPR0312F    $2.85/each  Dobmeier 

    BRAND: LAM312FH 
 
73.       Duster, Lamb Texas Feather #942                                           $3.73/each  Dobmeier 
                 BRAND: LAM350EX 
 
74.            Duster, Feather 14" Texas Feather #46000-12                         $2.00/each  Dobmeier 

     BRAND: LAMD13EC 
 
75.            Gloves – Reusable Latex, Big Time Products #8543-12           $4.28/dozen  Dobmeier 
                  BRAND: West 
 
76.             Goves - Quality General Purpose West                                      $4.28/box  Dobmeier 

      Flock-Lined, Latex .018 Gauge, Large *No Substitutions 
 
77.             Gloves - Yellow Rubber - Large- Westchester                  $4.28/dozen  Dobmeier 
                  BRAND: West 
    
78.              Gloves - Brown Jersey Cotton Gloves - Large                         $3.11/dozen  Dobmeier 
                   BRAND: West 
 
79.              Gloves - Vinyl Powder Free #WES2750S, Small 100/Box         $3.03/box  Dobmeier 
                   BRAND: West 
 
80                Gloves – Vinyl Powder Free #WES2750M, Medium 100/Box    $3.03/box  Dobmeier 
                    BRAND: West 
 
81.               Gloves – Vinyl Powder Free #WES2750L, Large 100/Box        $3.03/box  Dobmeier 
                    BRAND: West 
 
82.                Gloves – Vinyl Powder Free #WES2750XL, XLarge 100/Box   $3.03/box  Dobmeier 
                     BRAND: West 
 
83.                 Pads Steel Wool, Medium Flo-Pac #446 16/Sleeve              $3.26/box        Dobmeier  
                     
84.                 Pads Scouring Micro #96 6 x 9 1/2, 60/Case              $8.58/box  Dobmeier 
                      BRAND: SSS Micro 
 
85.                 Pads 3M 96 Scrubbers, *No Substitutions                                $8.28/box  Dobmeier 
 
86.                 Pads, 3M Green Hand Pads #96, 60/Case                               $24.83/case  Dobmeier  
                      *No Substitutions    
 
87.                 Pads, Polishing and Buffing, 20” white #2736                           $11.00/case  Dobmeier 
                      BRAND: SSS 
 
88.                 Pads, Stripping 20” black                                                           $11.00/case    Dobmeier 
                      BRAND: SSS 
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VI.    JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS- CONTINUED: 
 
89.          Sponges, Cellulose Glt 6 AV 6 x 4 x 12, 24/Case                     $11.19/case Corr 
               BRAND: Hydra 
 
90.          Sponges, Cellulose Gltt 7 AV 15/8 x 4 1/4 x 6 24/Case            $15.96/case Dobmeier 
               BRAND: SSS 
 
91.           Sponges – Slab – Ocello                                      $50.00/bndle Dobmeier 
                BRAND: Ocello 
 
92.           Magic Erasers, Mr. Clean 8/Box *No Substitutions  $7.25/box Dobmeier 
 
93.           Pledge Grab-It-Refills 20 count #40325               $42.80/each Dobmeier 
 
94.           Putty Knife 1 1/4" Wide Blade      $ .89/each Dobmeier 
                BRAND: RD4701 
 
95.           Scraper  Blade Razor Unger #STO 100/Box   $5.26/each Corr 
                BRAND: Unger 
 
96.           Scraper Razor Type Unger  #ST50                                     $1.31/each Corr 
                 BRAND: Unger 
  
97.            Scraper, Long Handle #2562                                                 $10.72/each Corr 
                 BRAND:  Unger 
  
98.            Scraper, Long Handle #3448                                                 $7.99/each Dobmeier 
                 BRAND: CON2562 
 
99.            Scraper Short Handle, Unger #1703                          $5.71/each Corr 
                 BRAND: Unger 
 
100.         Scraper Blades 4" Unger Only, 10/Tube    $3.07/each Corr 
                 BRAND: Unger 
 
101.          Scraper Blades for Short Handle Scraper #1705, 10/Tube   $3.07/each Corr 
                 BRAND: Unger 
 
102.          Squeege-Window 18" Wide w/Blade/track/handle                $3.30/each Corr 
                 BRAND: Unger 
 
103.           Squeege-Floor- 1/8" x 1" Angle Iron to Hold  1/4 x 2"           $3.37/each Corr 
                  Gum Rubber,  Blade 18" Long No Handles 
                  BRAND: Unger 
 
104.            Squeege  12” #2472 complete with handle                           $3.07/each Corr 
 
105.            Squeege-Heavy Duty Floor 30"-Unger #HM30                           $10.02/each Corr 
                   *No Substitutions      
 
 



COUNTY OF ERIE, STATE OF NEW YORK                                   PAGE 2Q OF 6 PAGES 
DIVISION OF PURCHASE                                                               95 FRANKLIN STREET, ROOM 1254 
INVITATION TO BID NO. 290001-004                                               BUFFALO, NEW YORK 14202 
 
                                    
         DESCRIPTION                  PRICE     VENDOR 
 
VI.    JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS- CONTINUED:               
 
106.          Squeege-Floor,Moss Rubber 22",Unger #MW22              $4.85/each Corr      
                 *No Substitutions 
                          
107.          Squeege  - Handle 56" - Unger #Al56, *No Substitutions!    $4.99/each Corr 
 
108.          Squeege -  Handle, Speed Sweep  - Continental #5400W   $2.53/each Dobmeier 
                 BRAND: RM352 
 
109.          Squeege Assembly Kit                                                           $3.66/each Dobmeier 
                 BRAND:  CON2475-18 
 
110.          Wax Applicator #120, Complete w/Head,                                     $6.70/each Corr 
                 Handle & Fleece 12"  
                 BRAND: US 
 
111.          Wax Applicator - Floor, Head Only, 12" - Just Fleece,        $3.74/each Dobmeier 
                 Genuine Lambswool, Refill 

     BRAND: LAM126R 
 
112.         Unger Professional Brass Window Squeege Handles          $3.77/each Dobmeier 
     *No Substitutions 
 
113.          Unger Professional Brass Channels with rubber 12"    $3.13/each Corr 
      *No Substitutions 
                            
114.          Unger Professional Brass Channels with rubber 18"     $4.35/each Corr 
      *No Substitutions  
 
115            Unger 12” Rubber Blade for Unger Professional Squeege          $ .79/each Corr 
                  *No Substitutions 
 
116.           Toilet Flex Plungers 8" Diameter, Continental                             $3.00/each Chudy                           
                    BRAND: Tolco 
 
117.           Turkish Towels, #N5029080, 10# pkg. - White Only             $25.85/each    Dobmeier 
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VI.    JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS- CONTINUED: 
 
118.        Cheesecloth, grade 10, white, bleached 100% cotton                 No Bid  
               36" wide (80 yards/ bolts) 
 
119.         Dust Cloths – Yellow, 50 Ct. 500/Case         $62.91/case Corr                               
    
120.         Vacuum Cleaner Bags Dirt Devil #43393, 3/Pkg                           $5.60/pkg Corr 
                *No Substitutions  
                            
121.          Vacuum Cleaner Bags, SW Brand  Type F & G               $1.03/each Corr 
                  For Eureka Uprights - *No Substitutions 
 
122.          Vacuum Cleaner Bags - Mastercraft #4328, *No Substitutions    $20.50/each Dobmeier 
 
123.          Vacuum Cleaner Bags - Mastercraft #M-59, 5/Pkg.      $6.50/each Dobmeier 
                 *No Substitutions   
 
124.          Vacuum Cleaner Bags, Clarke #50721B, 10 bags/pkg.     $14.70/pkg Dobmeier 
      *No Substitutions 
 
125.           Vacuum Cleaner Belts, SSS #30563A for Mdl.HD100     $ .30/each Dobmeier 
                  *No Substitutions 
 
126.            Vacuum Cleaner Belts for Hoover,                           $ .30/each Dobmeier 
                   Part #25/049258AG, *No Substitutions  

               
127.            Dispenser for Microburst 9000 Linen TC-410218   $36.00/each Dobmeier 
                  *No Substitutions 
 
128.            Trigger Bottle 22 Oz. #932B                                       $ .33/each Dobmeier  
 
129.            Trigger Bottle 24 Oz. #924 Complete w/Nozzle                           $ .55/each Griffin 
                            
130.            Gallon Jug with Cap                                                   $ .90/each Dobmeier 
                            
131.             Wet Floor Sign - SSS                                                                $6.00/each Dobmeier 
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VI. JANITORIAL SUPPLIES MISCELLANEOUS- CONTINUED: 
 
132.        Waste Baskets #2818                                     $2.40/each Dobmeier 
 
133.         Funnel  32 Oz. #1577 - Red                                               $4.50/each Corr 
 
134.        Continental Janitor Cart W/Bag #1292, *No Substitutions            $73.14/each Dobmeier   
            
135.        Continental Cart Bag #51-*No Substitutions             $13.19/each  Corr   
 
136.        Continental Folding Cart #5 #275 *No Substitutions                     $97.45/each  Chudy 
 
137.        Continental Locking Compartment #1295 *No Substitutions!        $43.08/each  Corr     
  
138.        Dial Soap Dispenser Model #21 - Liter Size*No Substitutions   $1.00/each  Dobmeier 
                     
139.        Rubbermaid #2947 Trash Can, Round  *No Substitutions!            $6.71/each  Corr 
 
140.        Rubbermaid Brute Container #2643 *No Substitutions!             $23.30/each  Corr 
 
141.        Rubbermaid #263200GY, 32 Gallon Round Brute                          $14.10/each  Dobmeier 
               Refuse Container, Gray, *No Substitutions! 
 
142.        Rubbermaid #263100GY, Round Brute Lid for 32              $4.82/each  Dobmeier 
               Gallon Container, Gray, *No Substitutions! 
 
143.        Rubbermaid #354600 22/23 Gallon Round Receptacle                 $35.95/each  Dobmeier 
               30 1/8 H, Beige or Gray, *No Substitutions! 
 
144.        Rubbermaid #267200 Free Swinging Lid for 22/23 Round            $19.00/each  Dobmeier 
               Receptacle, Beige or Gray, *No Substitutions! 
 
145.        Rubbermaid Brute Dolly #2640 *No Substitutions!                     $16.35/each  Dobmeier 
 
146.        Rubbermaid Brute Caddy Bag #2642  *No Substitutions!              $19.02/each  Corr 
 
147.        Speedi Dry Floor Absorbent, 40# Bag -     $5.75/each  Chudy 
               BRAND: Melten                       
 
148.        Car Wash Metal Only 55 Gallon Drum - Johnson or Equal         $139.00/each    Dobmeier 
               BRAND: Johnson Fleet Wash 
 
149.        Car Wash, Gallon Size      $3.50/each   Dobmeier 
               
150.        Wall Ash Trays Continental #650 *No Substitutions  $55.00/each   Chudy 
 
151.        Shower Curtains, 42”x 72” Hospeco #100SC              $5.50/each   Dobmeier 
                 
      
 
 



 
 
 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES  
BID NO.: 290001-004 
CONTRACT TERM:  JANUARY 1, 2009 – DECEMBER 31, 2009 
MATERIAL GROUP #192 
PURCHASING GROUP #004 

VENDOR INFORMATION 
 
CHUDY PAPER COMPANY, INC. – VENDOR #109646 
930 Bailey Avenue 
Buffalo, New York 14206 
Telephone #825-1935 
Fax # 825-0319 
Terms: Net-30 
Minimum Order: $150.00 or $25.00 Handling Fee 
 
CORR DISTRIBUTORS, INC. – VENDOR #109655 
89 Pearce Avenue 
Tonawanda, New York 14150 
Telephone #873-8323 
Fax #873-2968 
Terms: Net-30 
Minimum Order: None 
 
DOBMEIER JANITOR SUPPLY, INC. – VENDOR #101035 
354 Englewood Avenue 
Buffalo, New York 14223 
Telephone #833-2005 
Fax #833-2024 
Terms: Net-30 
Minimum Order: $100.00 or $10.00 Handling Fee 
 
GRIFFIN CHEMICAL COMPANY, LLC. – VENDOR #116234 
2624 Parker Blvd. 
Tonawanda, New York 14150 
Telephone #693-2465 
Fax #693-2467 
Terms: Net-30 
Minimum Order: $100.00 or $20.00 Handling Fee 
 
 
 

         
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

TO:   ALL REQUISITIONERS 
 
FROM:  Denyse Insalaco-Weatherbee, Purchasing Department 
 
DATE:  December 12, 2008 
 
SUBJECT:  JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR 2009 
 
++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 
 
Please be advised that the 2009 contract for Janitorial Supplies has been awarded.  All 
prices listed are good for one year.  When preparing any requisitions, be sure to meet 
any minimum order requirement, and if not be sure to include the handling charge. 
 
Please reference bid number 290001-004 on all orders.  Do not call vendors to place 
orders.  Put your department’s requirements on a requisition. To expedite orders, they 
can be faxed in by the Purchasing Department.  Vendors require a purchase order 
number to invoice against.  By putting requisitions through the system when supplies are 
needed, it avoids any invoicing problems. Vendors will know what department to invoice 
and the comptroller’s office will know what purchase order that invoice is against. 
Vendors are required to list the purchase order number on the invoice.  If they don’t 
have a purchase order number, or if it is a bogus number it can create problems for 
payments.     
Some vendors did not respond to the bid this year.  For items that have been purchased 
from Emulso, I would suggest setting up a Blanket Order for five hundred dollars and 
order as needed.  (A verbal order for this would be acceptable).    
 
For your convenience I am enclosing a copy of the 2009 line items price list. 
 
Diw 
Att. 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 


